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Understanding Substance Abuse Disorders: An Overview
of the 6 Types
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Substance abuse disorders can manifest in various forms, and understanding their different
types is a crucial step towards recovery. If you're in Ogden, Utah, searching for effective
treatment options such as "drug rehab," Renaissance Ranch Ogden is here to assist you on
your recovery journey.

What is Substance Abuse Disorders?

Substance abuse disorders, also known as drug use disorders, refer to a group of mental
health conditions characterized by a compulsive and harmful pattern of using substances like
drugs or alcohol. Individuals with this disorder exhibit a dependency on these substances,
causing significant impairment and distress in their lives.

Despite the negative consequences, people with substance abuse disorders continue to
excessively use the substance, leading to issues with health, relationships, or work. They
often have an overwhelming urge to use the substance, face difficulty controlling how much

https://renaissanceranchogden.com/understanding-substance-abuse-disorders-an-overview-of-the-6-types/
https://renaissanceranchogden.com/5-life-changing-benefits-of-completing-drug-rehab/
https://renaissanceranchogden.com/medicaid-accepted-drug-alcohol-treatment/
https://renaissanceranchogden.com/regain-control-with-comprehensive-drug-alcohol-addiction-treatment-at-renaissance-ranch-ogden/


2/3

or how often they use it and spend a great deal of their time obtaining, using, or recovering
from the substance.

These disorders can be chronic and relapsing but are treatable. Treatment usually includes a
combination of medication, counseling, and long-term follow-up to prevent relapse. This
recovery journey, while challenging, can lead to a healthier and more fulfilling life.

The Six Types of Substance Abuse Disorders

Substance abuse disorders are typically categorized into six types. Each type has unique
characteristics, but all have the potential to disrupt the lives of individuals and their loved
ones.

Alcohol Use Disorder

Alcohol use disorder involves a pattern of compulsive alcohol use, lack of control over
alcohol intake, and a negative emotional state when not drinking. Despite its social
acceptance, alcohol can lead to a destructive addiction.

Cannabis Use Disorder

Also known as marijuana use disorder, cannabis use disorder involves the use of cannabis to
the point where it hampers daily activities. Despite the changes in legalities and perceptions,
cannabis can still lead to dependency and addiction.

Phencyclidine Use Disorder

Phencyclidine, also known as PCP or Angel Dust, is a type of hallucinogen. Its use can lead
to addiction and has severe physical and psychological effects, creating a disruptive pattern
in an individual's life.

Other Hallucinogen Use Disorder

This category includes the misuse of hallucinogens other than phencyclidine. These
substances alter an individual's thoughts and feelings, potentially leading to substantial
challenges and addiction.

Inhalant Use Disorder

Inhalant use disorder involves the misuse of household substances like aerosols, glue, or
paint thinners. These substances are often readily available, making this type of addiction
common and particularly dangerous.

Opioid Use Disorder
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This category includes misuse of both prescription opioids and illegal drugs like heroin. The
current opioid crisis highlights the potential for addiction and the severe effects of this type of
disorder.

Approaching Recovery: Treatment Options

Recovery from substance abuse starts with understanding the disorder and seeking help.
Renaissance Ranch Ogden offers comprehensive drug addiction treatment that helps you
navigate the path to sobriety.

Empowering Recovery from Substance Abuse

Understanding the type of substance abuse disorder is the first step to seeking the right help.
With the proper guidance and support, overcoming addiction and moving towards a healthier,
fulfilling life is possible.

Start Your Recovery Journey Today

Ready to embark on your recovery journey? Call Renaissance Ranch Ogden today at (385)
222-3737 or visit our contact page. We provide the support and treatment you need to
overcome substance abuse and rebuild your life.

Whether you or a loved one is grappling with substance abuse, remember that help is
available. Reach out to us today. 

Your journey to recovery and a healthier, fulfilling life starts here at Renaissance
Ranch Ogden.
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